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背景信息

Corruption directly or indirectly affects individuals and societies, regardless of the
context and stage of development in any country. It can be present throughout
different shapes and nuances by intensifying disparities in the most vulnerable
people. It can cause detrimental effects on the enjoyment of Human Rights and
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set hurdles for their promotion and protection.

Because of the universal, indivisible, interrelated, interdependent, and mutually
reinforcing nature of Human Rights, corruption can trigger a domino effect on
civil, political, economic, social, and cultural rights by weakening the rule of law,
good governance at all levels, and hampering transparent, effective, and
accountable institutions, among other consequences. Likewise, they can reduce
resources available to cover needs and root vicious cycles towards immoral and
unlawful practices. Therefore, mainstreaming knowledge about this problem
pursues the transformation of discriminatory social institutions, laws, cultural
norms, and community practices, such as those limiting access and the full
enjoyment of Human Rights.

活动目标

As a contribution to this endeavor, the Rule of Law and Anti-Corruption Centre
(ROLACC) and the United Institute for Training and Research (UNITAR) have
brought together their expertise and practical knowledge to collaboratively
developed the e-learning course on “Anticorruption and Human Rights:
Mainstreaming Anticorruption for the effective promotion and protection of
Human Rights.”

目标受众

The course is designed for supporting delegates of States and other relevant
stakeholders working on anticorruption and sustainable development from
developed and developing countries.


